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letter of Prior Informed Consent on Nomination of

Chinese Shadow Puppetry for Inscription on

Representative list of Intangible Cultural Heritage

Chinese Shadow Puppetry has gained popularity around China with a history of
over a thousand years. In order to protect and develop it well, as inheritors and
holders of Chinese Shadow Puppetry, we are willing to nominate it to UNESCO
for Inscription on Representative List of Intangible Cultural Heritage and strive
for its long-term protection and succession.

China Shadow Puppet

China Puppetry and Shadow

Arts Association



Letter of Prior Informed Consent on Nomination of

Chinese Shadow Puppetry for Inscription on

Representative List of Intangible Cultural Heritage

Chinese Shadow Puppetry has gained popularity around China with a history of
over a thousand years. In order to protect and develop it well, as inheritors and
holders of Chinese Shadow Puppetry, we are willing to nominate it to UNESCO
for Inscription on Representative List of Intangible Cultural Heritage and strive
for its long-term protection and succession.

Tangshan Shadow Puppet

Tangshan Shadow Puppet Troupe



Letter of Prior Informed Consent on Nomination of

Chinese Shadow Puppetry for Inscription on

Representative List of Intangible Cultural Heritage

Chinese Shadow Puppetry has gained popularity around China with a history of
over a thousand years. In order to protect and develop~ it well, as inheritors and
holders of Chinese Shadow Puppetry, we are willing to nominate it to UNESCO
for Inscription on Representative List of Intangible Cultural Heritage and strive
for its long-term protection and succession.

Jinan Shadow Puppet

Handan Mass Art Hall



letter of Prior Informed Consent on Nomination of

Chinese Shadow Puppetry for Inscription on

Representative list of Intangible Cultural Heritage

Chinese Shadow Puppetry has gained popularity around China with a history of
over a thousand years. In order to protect and develop it well, as inheritors and
holders of Chinese Shadow Puppetry, we are willing to nominate it to UNESCO
for Inscription on Representative List of Intangible Cultural Heritage and strive
for its long-term protection and succession.

Hejian Shadow Puppet

Hejian Culture Hall



Letter of Prior Informed Consent on Nomination of

Chinese Shadow Puppetry for Inscription on

Representative List of Intangible Cultural Heritage

Chinese Shadow Puppetry has gained popularity around China with a history of
over a thousand years. In order to protect and develop it well, as inheritors and
holders of Chinese Shadow Puppetry, we are willing to nominate it to UNESCO
for Inscription on Representative List of Intangible Cultural Heritage and strive
for its long-term protection and succession.

Fuzhou Shadow Puppet

Wafangdian Culture Hall

Fuzhou Branch



Letter of Prior Informed Consent on Nomination of

Chinese Shadow Puppetry for Inscription on

Representative List of Intangible Cultural Heritage

Chinese Shadow Puppetry has gained popularity around China with a history of
over a thousand years. In order to protect and develop it well, as inheritors and
holders of Chinese Shadow Puppetry, we are willing to nominate it to UNESCO
for Inscription on Representative List of Intangible Cultural Heritage and strive
for its long-term protection and succession.

Lingyuan Shadow Puppet

Lingyuan Intangible Cultural

Heritage Protection Centre



letter of Prior Informed Consent on Nomination of

Chinese Shadow Puppetry for Inscription on

Representative list of Intangible Cultural Heritage

Chinese Shadow Puppetry has gained popularity around China with a history of
over a thousand years. In order to protect and develop it well, as inheritors and
holders of Chinese Shadow Puppetry, we are willing to nominate it to UNESCO
for Inscription on Representative List of Intangible Cultural Heritage and strive
for its long-term protection and succession.

Haining Shadow Puppet

Haining Culture Hall



Letter of Prior Informed Consent on Nomination of

Chinese Shadow Puppetry for Inscription on

Representative List of Intangible Cultural Heritage

Chinese Shadow Puppetry has gained popularity around China with a history of
over a thousand years. In order to protect and develop it well, as inheritors and
holders of Chinese Shadow Puppetry, we are willing to nominate it to UNESCO
for Inscription on Representative List of Intangible Cultural Heritage and strive
for its long-term protection and succession.

Sichuan Shadow Puppet

Nanbu County Culture Hall



Letter of Prior Informed Consent on Nomination of

Chinese Shadow Puppetry for Inscription on

Representative List of Intangible Cultural Heritage

Chinese Shadow Puppetry has gained popularity around China with a history of
over a thousand years. In order to protect and develop it well, as inheritors and
holders of Chinese Shadow Puppetry, we are willing to nominate it to UNESCO
for Inscription on Representative List of Intangible Cultural Heritage and strive
for its long-term protection and succession.

Sichuan Shadow Puppet

Langzhong Culture Hall



Letter of Prior Informed Consent on Nomination of

Chinese Shadow Puppetry for Inscription on

Representative List of Intangible Cultural Heritage

Chinese Shadow Puppetry has gained popularity around China with a history of
over a thousand years. In order to protect and develop it well, as inheritors and
holders of Chinese Shadow Puppetry, we are willing to nominate it to UNESCO
for Inscription on Representative List of Intangible Cultural Heritage and strive
for its long-term protection and succession.

Xiaoyi Shadow Puppet

Xiaoyi Shadow Puppet Troupe



letter of Prior Informed Consent on Nomination of

Chinese Shadow Puppetry for Inscription on

Representative list of Intangible Cultural Heritage

Chinese Shadow Puppetry has gained popularity around China with a history of
over a thousand years. In order to protect and develop it well, as inheritors and
holders of Chinese Shadow Puppetry, we are willing to nominate it to UNESCO
for Inscription on Representative List of Intangible Cultural Heritage and strive
for its long-term protection and succession.

Huaxian Shadow Puppet

Weinan Mass Art Hall



Letter of Prior Informed Consent on Nomination of

Chinese Shadow Puppetry for Inscription on

Representative List of Intangible Cultural Heritage

Chinese Shadow Puppetry has gained popularity around China with a history of
over a thousand years. In order to protect and develop it well, as inheritors and
holders of Chinese Shadow Puppetry, we are willing to nominate it to UNESCO
for Inscription on Representative List of Intangible Cultural Heritage and strive
for its long-term protection and succession.

Huayin Lao Qiang Opera

Huayin Laoqiang Opera

Folk Art Group



letter of Prior Informed Consent on Nomination of

Chinese Shadow Puppetry for Inscription on

Representative list of Intangible Cultural Heritage

Chinese Shadow Puppetry has gained popularity around China with a history of
over a thousand years. In order to protect and develop it well, as inheritors and
holders of Chinese Shadow Puppetry, we are Willing to nominate it to UNESCO
for Inscription on Representative List of Intangible Cultural Heritage and strive
for its long-term protection and succession.

Xiuyan Shadow Puppet

Xiuyan Culture Hall



letter of Prior Informed Consent on Nomination of

Chinese Shadow Puppetry for Inscription on

Representative list of Intangible Cultural Heritage

Chinese Shadow Puppetry has gained popularity around China with a history of
over a thousand years. In order to protect and develop it well, as inheritors and
holders of Chinese Shadow Puppetry, we are willing to nominate it to UNESCO
for Inscription on Representative List of Intangible Cultural Heritage and strive
for its long-term protection and succession.

Gaizhou Shadow Puppet

Gaizhou Culture Hall



letter of Prior Informed Consent on Nomination of

Chinese Shadow Puppetry for Inscription on

Representative list of Intangible Cultural Heritage

Chinese Shadow Puppetry has gained popularity around China with a history of
over a thousand years. In order to protect and develop it well, as inheritors and
holders of Chinese Shadow Puppetry, we are willing to nominate it to UNESCO
for Inscription on Representative List of Intangible Cultural Heritage and strive
for its long-term protection and succession.

Wangkui Shadow Puppet

WangkuiCulture Hall



letter of Prior Informed Consent on Nomination of

Chinese Shadow Puppetry for Inscription on

Representative list of Intangible Cultural Heritage

Chinese Shadow Puppetry has gained popularity around China with a history of
over a thousand years. In order to protect and develop it well, as inheritors and
holders of Chinese Shadow Puppetry, we are willing to nominate it to UNESCO
for Inscription on Representative List of Intangible Cultural Heritage and strive
for its long-term protection and succession.

Beijing Shadow Puppet

Beijing Shadow Puppet Troupe



Letter of Prior Informed Consent on Nomination of

Chinese Shadow Puppetry for Inscription on

Representative List of Intangible Cultural Heritage

Chinese Shadow Puppetry has gained popularity around China with a history of
over a thousand years. In order to protect and develop it well, as inheritors and
holders of Chinese Shadow Puppetry, we are willing to nominate it to UNESCO
for Inscription on Representative List of Intangible Cultural Heritage and strive
for its long-term protection and succession.

Taishan Shadow Puppet

Tai'an Culture Hall



letter of Prior Informed Consent on Nomination of

Chinese Shadow Puppetry for Inscription on

Representative list of Intangible Cultural Heritage

Chinese Shadow Puppetry has gained popularity around China with a history of
over a thousand years. In order to protect and develop it well, as inheritors and
holders of Chinese Shadow Puppetry, we are willing to nominate it to UNESCO
for Inscription on Representative List of Intangible Cultural Heritage and strive
for its long-term protection and succession.

Jinan Shadow Puppet

Jinan Mass Art Hall



Letter of Prior Informed Consent on Nomination of

Chinese Shadow Puppetry for Inscription on

Representative List of Intangible Cultural Heritage

Chinese Shadow Puppetry has gained popularity around China with a history of
over a thousand years. In order to protect and develop it well, as inheritors and
holders of Chinese Shadow Puppet:v, we are willing to nominate it to UNESCO
for Inscription on Representative List of Intangible Cultural Heritage and strive
for its long-term protection and succession.

Dingtao Shadow Puppet

Dingtao county cultura centers

In Shandong Province



letter of Prior Informed Consent on Nomination of

Chinese Shadow Puppetry for Inscription on

Representative list of Intangible Cultural Heritage

Chinese Shadow Puppetry has gained popularity around China with a history of
over a thousand years. In order to protect and develop it well, as inheritors and
holders of Chinese Shadow Puppetry, we are willing to nominate it to UNESCO
for Inscription on Representative List of Intangible Cultural Heritage and strive
for its long-term protection and succession.

Luoshan Shadow Puppet

Luoshan Culture Hall



Letter of Prior Informed Consent on Nomination of

Chinese Shadow Puppetry for Inscription on

Representative List of Intangible Cultural Heritage

Chinese Shadow Puppetry has gained popularity around China with a history of
over a thousand years. In order to protect and develop it well, as inheritors and
holders of Chinese Shadow Puppetry, we are willing to nominate it to UNESCO
for Inscription on Representative List of Intangible Cultural Heritage and strive
for its long-term protection and succession.

Hunan Shadow Puppet

Hunan Puppet and Shadow

Art Theatre



Letter of Prior Informed Consent on Nomination of

Chinese Shadow Puppetry for Inscription on

Representative List of Intangible Cultural Heritage

Chinese Shadow Puppetry has gained popularity around China with a history of
over a thousand years. In order to protect and develop it well, as inheritors and
holders of Chinese Shadow Puppetry, we are willing to nominate it to UNESCO
for Inscription on Representative List of Intangible Cultural Heritage and strive
for its long-term protection and succession.

Hunan Shadow Puppet

Hengshan Culture Hall



letter of Prior Informed Consent on Nomination of

Chinese Shadow Puppetry for Inscription on

Representative list of Intangible Cultural Heritage

Chinese Shadow Puppetry has gained popularity around China with a history of
over a thousand years. In order to protect and develop it well, as inheritors and
holders of Chinese Shadow Puppetry, we are Willing to nominate it to UNESCO
for Inscription on Representative List of Intangible Cultural Heritage and strive
for its long-term protection and succession.

Jianghan Plain Shadow Puppet

Qianjiang Mass Art Hall



letter of Prior Informed Consent on Nomination of

Chinese Shadow Puppetry for Inscription on

Representative list of Intangible Cultural Heritage

Chinese Shadow Puppetry has gained popularity around China with a history of
over a thousand years. In order to protect and develop it well, as inheritors and
holders of Chinese Shadow Puppetry, we are willing to nominate it to UNESCO
for Inscription on Representative List of Intangible Cultural Heritage and strive
for its long-term protection and succession.

Lufeng Shadow Puppet

Lufeng Shadow Puppet Troup



letter of Prior Informed Consent on Nomination of

Chinese Shadow Puppetry for Inscription on

Representative list of Intangible Cultural Heritage

Chinese Shadow Puppetry has gained popularity around China with a history of
over a thousand years. In order to protect and develop it well, as inheritors and
holders of Chinese Shadow Puppetry, we are willing to nominate it to UNESCO
for Inscription on Representative List of Intangible Cultural Heritage and strive
for its long-term protection and succession.

Egong Qiang Opera

Fuping County Egong Troup



Letter of Prior Informed Consent on Nomination of

Chinese Shadow Puppetry for Inscription on

Representative List of Intangible Cultural Heritage

Chinese Shadow Puppetry has gained popularity around China with a history of
over a thousand years. In order to protect and develop it well, as inheritors and
holders of Chinese Shadow Puppetry, we are willing to nominate it to UNESCO
for Inscription on Representative List of Intangible Cultural Heritage and strive
for its long-term protection and succession.

Qianxian Xianban Qiang Opera

Intangible Cultural Heritage

Protection Centre of Qianxian

County



Letter of Prior Informed Consent on Nomination of

Chinese Shadow Puppetry for Inscription on

Representative List of Intangible Cultural Heritage

Chinese Shadow Puppetry has gained popularity around China with a history of
over a thousand years. In order to protect and develop it well, as inheritors and
holders of Chinese Shadow Puppetry, we are willing to nominate it to UNESCO
for Inscription on Representative List of Intangible Cultural Heritage and strive
for its long-term protection and succession.

Huanxian Shadow Puppet

Huanxian County Culture Hall



Letter of Prior Informed Consent on Nomination of

Chinese Shadow Puppetry for Inscription on

Representative List of Intangible Cultural Heritage

Chinese Shadow Puppetry has gained popularity around China with a history of
over a thousand years. In order to protect and develop it well, as inheritors and
holders of Chinese Shadow Puppetry, we are willing to nominate it to UNESCO
for Inscription on Representative List of Intangible Cultural Heritage and strive
for its long-term protection and succession.

Hehuang Shadow Puppet

Qinghai Provincial Art Hall



Letter of Prior Informed Consent on Nomination of Chinese

Shadow Puppetry for Inscription on Representative Ust of Intangible
Cultural Heritage

Chinese Shadow Puppetry has gained popularity around China with a

inheritor of Chinese Shadow Puppetry, I am willing to nominate it to UNESCO
for Inscription on Representative List of Intangible Cultural Heritage.

i~~&:~~

Lingyuan Shadow Puppet

~~~w

Xu jishan



Letter of Prior Informed Consent on Nomination of Chinese

Shadow Puppetry for Inscription on Representative List of Intangible
Cultural Heritage

Chinese Shadow Puppetry has gained popularity around China with a
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inheritor of Chinese Shadow Puppetry, I am willing to nominate it to UNESCO
for Inscription on Representative List of Intangible Cultural Heritage.

i~rJj&:~~

Ungyuan Shadow Puppet

)<IJJt:f!f

Uu jingchun



letter of Prior Informed Consent on Nomination of Chinese

Shadow Puppetry for Inscription on Representative List of Intangible
Cultural Heritage

Chinese Shadow Puppetry has gained popularity around China with a
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inheritor of Chinese Shadow Puppetry, I am willing to nominate it to UNESCO
for Inscription on Representative List of Intangible Cultural Heritage.

Haining Shadow Puppet

Xu Ernan 1~-'f



letter of Prior Informed Consent on Nomination of Chinese

Shadow Puppetry for Inscription on Representative list of Intangible
Cultural Heritage

Chinese Shadow Puppetry has gained popularity around China with a
history of over a thousand years. In order to protect and develop it, as an
inheritor of Chinese Shadow Puppetry, I am willing to nominate it to UNESCO
for Inscription on Representative list of Intangible Cultural Heritage.

~~}j::15H~

Huayin Lao Qiang Opera

Zhang Ximin



Letter of Prior Informed Consent on Nomination of Chinese

Shadow Puppetry for Inscription on Representative List of Intangible
Cultural Heritage

Chinese Shadow Puppetry has gained popularity around China with a
history of over a thousand years. In order to protect and develop it, as an
inheritor of Chinese Shadow Puppetry, I am willing to nominate it to UNESCO
for Inscription on Representative List of Intangible Cultural Heritage.
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Huayin Lao Qiang Opera

Wang Zhenzhong



letter of Prior Informed Consent on Nomination of Chinese

Shadow Puppetry for Inscription on Representative list of Intangible
Cultural Heritage

Chinese Shadow Puppetry has gained popularity around China with a
history of over a thousand years. In order to protect and develop it, as an
inheritor of Chinese Shadow Puppetry, I am willing to nominate it to UNESCO
for Inscription on Representative list of Intangible Cultural Heritage.

~1+L&~~

Fuzhou Shadow Puppet

{!J\i~i* l~, 1~, v~

Sun Deshen



Letter of Prior Informed Consent on Nomination of Chinese

Shadow Puppetry for Inscription on Representative list of Intangible
Cultural Heritage

Chinese Shadow Puppetry has gained popularity around China with a
history of over a thousand years. In order to protect and develop it, as an
inheritor of Chinese Shadow Puppetry, I am willing to nominate it to UNESCO
for Inscription on Representative List Of Intangible Cultural Heritage.

Huanxian Shadow Puppet

Liu Hua



Letter of Prior Informed Consent on Nomination of Chinese

Shadow Puppetry for Inscription on Representative· list of Intangible
Cultural Heritage

Chinese Shadow Puppetry has gained popularity around China with a
history of over a thousand years. In order to protect and develop it, as an
inheritor of Chinese Shadow Puppetry, I am willing to nominate it to UNESCO
for Inscription on Representative list of Intangible Cultural Heritage.

Huanxian Shadow Puppet

iiiEi:*
Pan Jingle



letter of Prior Informed Consent on Nomination of Chinese

Shadow Puppetry for Inscription on Representative list of Intangible
Cultural Heritage

Chinese Shadow Puppetry has gained popularity around China with a
history of over a thousand years. In order to protect and develop it, as an
inheritor of Chinese Shadow Puppetry, I am willing to nominate it to UNESCO
for Inscription on Representative List of Intangible Cultural Heritage.
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Huanxian Daoqing Shadow Puppet

~~*

Shi Chenglin



Letter of Prior Informed Consent on Nomination of Chinese

Shadow Puppetry for Inscription on Representative list of Intangible
Cultural Heritage

Chinese Shadow Puppetry has gained popularity around China with a
history of over a thousand years. In order to protect and develop it, as an
inheritor of Chinese Shadow Puppetry, I am willing to nominate it to UNESCO
for Inscription on Representative List of Intangible Cultural Heritage.
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Huanxian Daoqing Shadow Puppet

~~flfa£

Gao Qingwang



Letter of Prior Informed Consent on Nomination of Chinese

Shadow Puppetry for Inscription on Representative list of Intangible
Cultural Heritage

Chinese Shadow Puppetry has gained popularity around China with a
history of over a thousand years. In order to protect and develop it, as an
inheritor of Chinese Shadow Puppetry, f am willing to nominate it to UNESCO
for Inscription on Representative List of Intangible Cultural Heritage.

~J1JBt~~

Tangshan Shadow Puppet

T~. -i {b~
Ding Zhenyao



Letter of Prior Informed Consent on Nomination of Chinese

Shadow Puppetry for Inscription on Representative list of Intangible
Cultural Heritage

Chinese Shadow Puppetry has gained popularity around China with a
history of over a thousand years. In order to protect and develop it, as an
inheritor of Chinese Shadow Puppetry, I am willing to nominate it to UNESCO
for Inscription on Representative list of Intangible Cultural Heritage.

nffUJBt~~

Tangshan Shadow Puppet

1f7k1jr

QiYongheng



letter of Prior Informed Consent on Nomination of Chinese

Shadow Puppetry for Inscription on Representative list of Intangible
Cultural Heritage

Chinese Shadow Puppetry has gained popularity around China with a
history of over a thousand years. In order to protect and develop it, as an
inheritor of Chinese Shadow Puppetry, I am willing to nominate it to UNESCO
for Inscription on Representative List of Intangible Cultural Heritage.
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Qianjiang Jianghan Plain Shadow Puppet

)(ljft:$ a.l ~5f
Liu Nianhua



letter of Prior Informed Consent on Nomination of Chinese

Shadow Puppetry for Inscription on Representative List of Intangible
Cultural Heritage

Chinese Shadow Puppetry has gained popularity around China with a
history of over a thousand years. In order to protect and develop it, as an
inheritor of Chinese Shadow Puppetry, I am willing to nominate it to UNESCO
for Inscription on Representative List of Intangible Cultural Heritage.
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Qianjiang Jianghan Plain Shadow Puppet

Tang Xiancheng



letter of Prior Informed Consent on Nomination of Chinese

Shadow Puppetry for Inscription on Representative List of Intangible
Cultural Heritage

Chinese Shadow Puppetry has gained popularity around China with a
history of over a thousand years. In order to protect and develop it, as an
inheritor of Chinese Shadow Puppetry, I am willing to nominate it to UNESCO
for Inscription on Representative List of Intangible Cultural Heritage.

Jinan Shadow Puppet

Shen Guorui



letter of Prior Informed Consent on Nomination of Chinese

Shadow Puppetry for Inscription on Representative list of Intangible
Cultural Heritage

Chinese Shadow Puppetry has gained popularity around China with a
history of over a thousand years. In order to protect and develop it, as an
inheritor of Chinese Shadow Puppetry, I am willing to nominate it to UNESCO
for Inscription on Representative List of Intangible Cultural Heritage.

~$Et~x&

Lufeng Shaapw Puppet

W3 ,~, t}~
Peng Zhong



letter of Prior Informed Consent on Nomination of Chinese

Shadow Puppetry for Inscription on Representative List of Intangible
Cultural Heritage

Chinese Shadow Puppetry has gained popularity around China with a
history of over a thousand years. In order to protect and develop it, as an
inheritor.f Chinese Shadow Puppetry, I am willing to nominate it to UNESCO
for Inscription on Representative List of Intangible Cultural Heritage.

~ill :$Et~5tJt

Lufeng Shadow Puppet

~fIIl~ *ur~'
Cai Jinzhen



Letter of Prior Informed Consent on Nomination of Chinese

Shadow Puppetry for Inscription on Representative List of Intangible
Cultural Heritage

Chinese Shadow Puppetry has gained popularity around China with a
history of over a thousand years. In order to protect and develop it, as an
inheritor of Chinese Shadow Puppetry, I am willing to nominate it to UNESCO
for Inscription on Representative List of Intangible Cultural Heritage.

Huanxian Shadow Puppet

Ir
~~~ ~

Wei Jinquan



Letter of Prior Informed Consent on Nomination of Chinese

Shadow Puppetry for Inscription on Representative List of Intangible
Cultural Heritage

Chinese Shadow Puppetry has gained popularity around China with a
history of over a thousand years. In order to protect and develop it, as an
inheritor of Chinese Shadow Puppetry, I am willing to nominate it to UNESCO
for Inscription on Representative List of Intangible Cultural Heritage.

• mm~)(Jt

Jinan Shadow Puppet
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Fu Xixian



letter of Prior Informed Consent on Nomination of Chinese

Shadow Puppetry for Inscription on Representative List of Intangible
Cultural Heritage

Chinese Shadow Puppetry has gained popularity around China with a
history of over a thousand years. In order to protect and develop it, as an
inheritor of Chinese Shadow Puppetry, I am willing to nominate it to UNESCO
for Inscription on Representative List of Intangible Cultural Heritage.

Z1:5(Et~~

Xiaoyi Shadow Puppet

Li Shiwei



letter of Prior Informed Consent on Nomina.tion of Chinese

Shadow Puppetry for Inscription on Representative List of Intangible
Cultural Heritage

Chinese Shadow Puppetry has gained popularity around China with a
history of over a thousand years. In order to protect and develop it, as an
inheritor of Chinese Shadow Puppetry, I am willing to nominate it to UNESCO
for Inscription on Representative List of Intangible Cultural Heritage.

Xiaoyi Shadow Puppet

~~~

Liang Quanmin
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Fuzhou Shadow Puppet

*IE~ *Vyo/'t~
Song Guochao



letter of Prior Informed Consent on Nomination of Chinese

Shadow Puppetry for Inscription on Representative List of intangible
Cultural Heritage

Chinese Shadow Puppetry has gained popularity around China with a
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inheritor of Chinese Shadow Puppetry, I am willing to nominate it to UNESCO
for Inscription on Representative List of Intangible Cultural Heritage.

~*5t*Ji~

Qianxian Xuanban Qiang Opera

*11.
Li Yuting



letter of Prior Informed Consent on Nomination of Chinese

Shadow Puppetry for Inscription on Representative list of Intangible
Cultural Heritage

Chinese Shadow Puppetry has gained popularity around China with a
history of over a thousand years. In order to protect and develop it, as an
inheritor of Chinese Shadow Puppetry, I am willing to nominate it to UNESCO
for Inscription on Representative List of Intangible Cultural Heritage.
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Qianxian Xuanban Qiang Opera

T~ft

Ding Bixia



Letter of Prior Informed Consent on Nomination of Chinese

Shadow Puppetry for Inscription on Representative List of Intangible
Cultural Heritage

Chinese Shadow Puppetry has gained popularity around China with a
history of over a thousand years. In order to protect and develop it, as an
inheritor of Chinese Shadow Puppetry, I am willing to nominate it to UNESCO
for Inscription on Representative List of Intangible Cultural Heritage.

luoshan Shadow Puppet

Chen Guanghui



Letter of Prior Informed Consent on Nomination of Chinese

Shadow Puppetry for Inscription on Representative List of Intangible
Cultural Heritage

Chinese Shadow Puppetry has gained popularity around China with a
history of over a thousand years. In order to protect and develop it, as an
inheritor of Chinese Shadow Puppetry, I am willing to nominate it to UNESCO
for Inscription on Representative List of Intangible Cultural Heritage.

Jinan Shadow Puppet

Li Xingshi



Letter of Prior Informed Consent on Nomination of Chinese

Shadow Puppetry for Inscription on Representative list of Intangible
Cultural Heritage

Chinese Shadow Puppetry has gained popularity around China with a
history of over a thousand years. In order to protect and develop it, as an
inheritor of Chinese Shadow Puppetry, I am willing to nominate it to UNESCO
for Inscription on Representative List of Intangible Cultural Heritage.

Haining Shadow Puppet

Wang Qiansong



Letter of Prior Informed Consent on Nomination of Chinese

Shadow Puppetry for Inscription on Representative List of Intangible
Cultural Heritage

Chinese Shadow Puppetry has gained popularity around China with a
history of over a thousand years. In order to protect and develop it, as an
inheritor of Chinese Shadow Puppetry, I am willing to nominate it to UNESCO
for Inscription on Representative List of Intangible Cultural Heritage.

Taishan Shadow Puppet

Fan Zhengan



Letter of Prior Informed Consent on Nomination of Chinese

Shadow Puppetry for Inscription on Representative List of Intangible
Cultural Heritage

Chinese Shadow Puppetry has gained popularity around China with a
history of over a thousand years. In order to protect and develop it, as an
inheritor of Chinese Shadow Puppetry, I am willing to nominate it to UNESCO
for Inscription on Representative List of Intangible Cultural Heritage.

Wangkui Shadow Puppet

Gu Baozhen



Letter of Prior Informed Consent on Nomination of Chinese

Shadow Puppetry for Inscription on Representative List of Intangible
Cultural Heritage

Chinese Shadow Puppetry has gained popularity around China with a
history of over a thousand years. In order to protect and develop it, as an
inheritor of Chinese Shadow Puppetry, I am willing to nominate it to UNESCO
for Inscription on Representative List of Intangible Cultural Heritage.

Haining Shadow Puppet

Zhang Kunrong



Letter of Prior Informed Consent on Nomination of Chinese

Shadow Puppetry for Inscription on Representative List of Intangible
Cultural Heritage

Chinese Shadow Puppetry has gained popularity around China with a
history of over a thousand years. In order to protect and develop it, as an
inheritor of Chinese Shadow Puppetry, I am willing to nominate it to UNESCO
for Inscription on Representative List of Intangible Cultural Heritage.

Tangshan Shadow Puppet

Liu Jiawen



Letter of Prior Informed Consent on Nomination of Chinese

Shadow Puppetry for Inscription on Representative List of Intangible
Cultural Heritage

Chinese Shadow Puppetry has gained popularity around China with a
history of over a thousand years. In order to protect and develop it, as an
inheritor of Chinese Shadow Puppetry, I am willing to nominate it to UNESCO
for Inscription on Representative List of Intangible Cultural Heritage.

Jinan Shadow Puppet

Li Xiushan


